
KOT A KINABALU; 
habits and love for books 
to be cultivated from child­
hood to foster highly _edu­
cated human capital for the 
nation's development. 

Minister of Education and 
Innovation Datuk Dr. Yusof 
Yacob said intellectual indi­
viduals in a of dis­

core 
in line 

"",'-:i;-i'I'" in fac-

the National Book 
augurated in 1988. 

'Through reading, our 
minds are taught towards ad­
vancing our nation therefore 
let me that it needs 
to be 

closing 
Borneo Book 
terday. 

The 
iliemed C~rn 
Masyarakat Intelek' saw more 
than 50 booths set up 
universities, government as 
well as private publishers 
from Sabah, Sarawak and 
Brunei. 

Organised Universiti 
Malaysia Sabah (UMS) this 
year, the annual book fair 
which has entered its fourth 
installation will be conducted 
by Universiti Malaysia 
Sarawak publishers in Kuching 
next year. 

"I would like to suggest that 
the organisers consider cre­
ating a 'Borneo Book Award' 
to be the main highlight in the 
next Borneo Book Fair. 

"I am proud that it is or­
ganised by Kota Kinabalu and 

• 
I 

mantan in future," said 
Yuso{; 

His 
Assistant 
Lasimbang. 

Jointly 
UMS in this 
Book Fair were Sabah Ed­

Department, Sabah 
Dewan Bahasa dan 

Sandapak En­
Publication 

" 

rector 
UMS Publishers l"li • ...,..,'",.. 

soc. Prof. Or. A5:m:lldv 

UMS Vice 
Prof. Oatuk 0 Kamarudin 0 
Mudin earlier said in his 

that the Borneo 
Fair, which was the 

brainchild of MAPIM who 
SUl~este:d UMS Publishers to 

~~.--,. i_ Borneo 
15, was aimed at pro­

habits in the 

sales and ex-

hibition of various genres 
reading materials, it will pro­
vide wider expo~ure and 
choices to visitors. 

"We hope that it will 
promote scholarly 
demic and non-academic 
books; we are also hopeful 
that the Borneo Book Fair will 
contribute to the govern­
ment's effort in elevating re­
gional relationship between 
Malaysia, Brunei and Kaliman­
tan as well as those under 
BIMP-EAGA," he said. 

His speech was delivered 
Normah. . 
, Also witnessed. 

ceremony was the 
of books published 
and UMS. 
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